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paperback. Book Condition: New. Ship out in 2 business day,
And Fast shipping, Free Tracking number will be provided after
the shipment.Paperback. Pub Date: 2013 Pages: 317 Language:
Chinese in Publisher: Chemical Industry Press. three-
dimensional model of manufacturing information resources:
the combination of the fixture manual and three-dimensional
gallery (CATIA) with the latest standards based. using manual
and 3D graphic combining forms. manuals and Gallery can be
used independently to improve the flexibility and convenience
of use. The book mainly includes small series of modular
fixture design parameters of standard parts. technical design
parameters of the medium-sized series of modular fixture
standard parts. large series of modular fixture technical design
parameters of the standard parts. technical design parameters
of H-type hole modular fixture standard parts. K-type hole
Department of modular fixture standard parts design
parameters. as well as the installation of the software. uninstall
and use. Established based on three-dimensional CADCAM
software CATIA 3D standard parts library. including all kinds of
combinations of standard fixture data and corresponding 3D
standard parts library. User manual and 3D graphic design
and manufacturing work. on the one hand. to avoid the
cumbersome standard parts designer graphics work. and
improve design efficiency; the other...
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